Drice Comparison			Original Bid October 14, 2021 - Sun Coast			February 2022 - Current			Re-Bid February 1, 2022 -			Re-Bid February 1, 2022 - American Lube Sup			
ITEM DESCRIPTION		Price Comparison  PRODUCT (OR EQUIVALENT TO) ESTIMAT				EXTENDED	Price PRICE EXTENDE		EXTENDED	Big Chief  BID PRICE EXTENDED				EXTENDED	
IIEWI	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT (ON EQUIVALENT TO)	QUANTITY	ы	DPRICE	PRICE		RICE	PRICE	ы	JPRICE	PRICE		BID PRICE	PRICE
1	Engine Oil 15W-40 Bulk:	Shell Rotella T5 Synthetic Blend 15W-40 Meets or exceeds the requirements of: API CK-4, Cummins CES 20086, Ford WSS-M2C171-F1	2000 Gals.	Per Gal:	\$ 17.00	\$ 34,000.00	Per Gal:	\$ 11.19	\$ 22,380.00	Per Gal:	\$ 15.85	\$ 31,700.00	Per Gal:	\$ 11.19	\$ 22,380.00
2	Engine Oil 5W-30 Bulk:	Pennzoil Platinum Full Synthetic 5W-30  Meets or exceeds the requirements of: API SN, GM dexos 1 Gen2,	600 Gals.	Per Gal.:	\$ 24.84	\$ 14,904.00	Per Gal.:	\$ 13.00	\$ 7,800.00	Per Gal.:	\$ 21.15	\$ 12,690.00	Per Gal.:	\$ 13.00	\$ 7,800.00
3	Engine Oil 5W-20 Bulk :	Motorcraft Synthetic Blend 5W-20 Meets or exceeds the requirements of: Ford WSS- M2C960-A1, API SN Plus	85 Gals. 6 Gal. Box	Per Gal:	\$ 26.47	\$ 2,249.95	Per Gal:	\$ 18.80	\$ 1,598.00	Per Gal:	\$ 18.89	\$ 1,605.65	Per Gal:	\$ 13.38	\$ 1,137.30
4	Engine Oil 0W-20 Bulk :	Motorcraft Full Synthetic 0W-20 meets or exceeds the requirements of: Ford WSS- M2C947-B1, API SN	60 Gals. 6 Gal. Box	Per Gal:	\$ 30.88	\$ 1,852.80	Per Gal:	\$ 27.32	\$ 1,639.20	Per Gal:	\$ 22.95	\$ 1,377.00	Per Gal:	\$ 16.88	\$ 1,012.80
5	Engine Oil 15W-40 :	Motorcraft Super Duty Formula 15W-40  Meets or exceeds the requirements of: Ford WSS-M2C171-F1	180 Qts. 12 qts/case	Per Qt:	\$ 7.54	\$ 1,357.20	Per Qt:	\$ 4.59	\$ 826.20	Per Qt:	\$ 4.95	\$ 891.00	Per Qt:	\$ 3.97	\$ 714.60
6	Engine Oil 0W-40:	Pennzoil Ultra Platinum Synthetic 0W-40 Meets or exceeds the requirements of: Chrysler MS- 12633, API SN	120 Qts. 12 qts/case	Per Qt:	\$ - NO BID	\$ -	Per Qt:	\$ 6.39	\$ 766.80	Per Qt:	\$ 10.45	\$ 1,254.00	Per Qt:	\$ - NO BID	\$ -
7	Transmission Fluid:	Motocraft Mercon V Full Synthetic ATF Manufacturer Part # XT-5-5QMC	60 Qts. 12 qts/case	Per Qt:	\$ 7.17	\$ 430.20	Per Qt:	\$ 4.58	\$ 274.80	Per Qt:	\$ 8.24	\$ 494.40	Per Qt:	\$ - NO BID	\$ -
8	Transmission Fluid:	Motocraft Mercon LV Full Synthetic ATF  Manufacturer Part # XT-10-QLVC	150 Qts. 12 qts/case	Per Qt:	\$ 7.17	\$ 1,075.50	Per Qt:	\$ 6.27	\$ 940.50	Per Qt:	\$ 8.24	\$ 1,236.00	Per Qt:	\$ 4.77	\$ 715.50
9	Transmission Fluid:	AC Delco Dexron VI Full Synthetic ATF Manufacturer Part # 10-9243	240 Qts. 12 qts/case	Per Qt:	\$ 8.01	\$ 1,922.40	Per Qt:	\$ 6.77	\$ 1,624.80	Per Qt:	\$ 8.24	\$ 1,977.60	Per Qt:	\$ 4.77	\$ 1,144.80
10	Transmission Fluid:	Chevron Delo Syn ATF 668.  Meets or exceeds the requirements of: Allison TES- 668	150 Gals. 1 Gal. Jugs	Per Gal:	\$ 42.55	\$ 6,382.50	Per Gal:	\$ 45.99	\$ 6,898.50	Per Gal:	\$ 44.85	\$ 6,727.50	Per Gal:	\$ 34.49	\$ 5,173.50
11	Hydraulic Oil Bulk:	Shell Tellus S2 MX 32 Hydraulic Fluid - AW32 Group II	2200 Gals.	Per Gal:	\$ 16.75	\$ 36,850.00	Per Gal:	\$ 8.48	\$ 18,656.00	Per Gal:	\$ 13.25	\$ 29,150.00	Per Gal:	\$ 8.66	\$ 19,052.00
12	Hydraulic Oil Bulk:	Shell Tellus S2 MX 68 Hydraulic Fluid - AW68 Group II	300 Gals.	Per Gal:	\$ 14.24	\$ 4,272.00	Per Gal:	\$ 12.10	\$ 3,630.00	Per Gal:	\$ 13.25	\$ 3,975.00	Per Gal:	\$ 8.66	\$ 2,598.00
13	<u>Grease Bulk</u> :	Chevron Delo Grease EP NLGI Grade 2	(3) 16 Gal Kegs - 120 Ibs. each	Per lb:	\$ 4.45	\$ 1,602.00	Per lb:	\$ 3.75	\$ 1,350.00	Per lb:	\$ 5.10	\$ 1,836.00	Per lb:	\$ 3.75	\$ 1,350.00
14	Grease Tube:	Chevron Delo Grease EP NLGI Grade 2 14 oz tube	200 Tubes	Per 14oz Tube:	\$ 4.72	\$ 944.00	Per 14oz Tube:	\$ 3.76	\$ 752.00	Per 14oz Tube:	\$ 3.75	\$ 750.00	Per 14oz Tube:	\$ 3.76	\$ 752.00
15	Grease Tube:	ATCO Impact Extra Heavy Duty Non Melt Grease NLGI Grade 2.5 14oz tubes Manufacturer Product Code: 4179-C50	500 Tubes	Per 14oz Tube:	NO BID		Per 14oz Tube:	\$ 8.29	\$ 4,145.00	Per 14oz Tube:	NO BID		Per 14oz Tube:	\$ 9.99	\$ 4,995.00
16	Diesel Exhaust Fluid Bulk:	Diesel Exhaust Fluid - ISO 22241 Compliant/API Certified	8800 Gals.	Per Gal:	\$ 3.13	\$ 27,544.00	Per Gal:	\$ 2.53	\$ 22,264.00	Per Gal:	\$ 2.95	\$ 25,960.00	Per Gal:	\$ 2.27	\$ 19,976.00
17	Diesel Exhaust Fluid:	Diesel Exhaust Fluid - ISO 22241 Compliant/API Certified	500 Gals. (2.5 Gal. Jug Each)	Per Gal:	\$ 5.30	\$ 2,650.00	Per Gal:	\$ 4.15	\$ 2,075.00	Per Gal:	\$ 4.95	\$ 2,475.00	Per Gal:	\$ 3.80	\$ 1,900.00
				Petroleum Bid Total: \$1		\$107,842.55	7,842.55 Petroleum T		otal \$73,281.80		ım Bid Total:	\$95,664.15	5 Petroleum Bid Total:		\$68,825.50
				DEF Bid		\$30,194.00			\$24,339.00			\$28,435.00			\$21,876.00
				Combine	d Total	\$138,036.55	Combine		\$97,620.80 pleum and DEF to			\$124,099.15 urrent lower cost		ed Bid Total	\$90,701.50
										Overall c	ost/bid lower th	han current pricin	g by:		\$6,727.70