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1
¾” Endopure Poly  Tubing/300’ 

Rolls(Blue SDR 9, 250 psi) 600 Ft. $.49 0.% $294.00 $.46 0.% $276.00 No Bid No Bid $.30 0.% $180.00 $.34 0.% $204.00 $39.00 0.% $23,400.00 No Bid $0.00

2
1” Endopure Poly  Tubing/300’ 

Rolls(Blue SDR 9, 250 psi) 600 Ft. $.77 0.% $462.00 $.77 0.% $462.00 No Bid No Bid $.45 0.% $270.00 $.54 0.% $324.00 $56.00 0.% $33,600.00 No Bid $0.00

3 4" C900 (DR 18) water pipe 80 Ft. $6.48 0.% $518.40 $5.18 0.% $414.40 No Bid No Bid $4.85 0.% $388.00 $5.96 0.% $476.80 $4.70 0.% $376.00 No Bid $0.00

4 6" C900 (DR 18) water pipe 250 Ft. $13.19 0.% $3,297.50 $10.55 0.% $2,637.50 No Bid No Bid $9.88 0.% $2,470.00 $12.12 0.% $3,030.00 $9.48 0.% $2,370.00 No Bid $0.00

5 8" C-900 (DR 18) water pipe 150 Ft. $22.64 0.% $3,396.00 $18.11 0.% $2,716.50 No Bid No Bid $11.60 0.% $1,740.00 $20.82 0.% $3,123.00 $16.28 0.% $2,442.00 No Bid $0.00

6 10" C-900 (DR 18) water pipe 80 Ft. $33.96 0.% $2,716.80 $27.17 0.% $2,173.60 No Bid No Bid $25.44 0.% $2,035.20 $31.24 0.% $2,499.20 $26.01 0.% $2,080.80 No Bid $0.00

7 12" C-900 (dr 18) water pipe 125 Ft. $47.84 0.% $5,980.00 $38.27 0.% $4,783.75 No Bid No Bid $35.84 0.% $4,480.00 $44.01 0.% $5,501.25 $35.25 0.% $4,406.25 No Bid $0.00

8 4" SDR 35 Sewer pipe 1500 Ft. $2.56 0.% $3,840.00 $2.05 0.% $3,075.00 No Bid No Bid $1.93 0.% $2,895.00 $2.38 0.% $3,570.00 $2.01 0.% $3,015.00 No Bid $0.00

9 6" SDR 26 Sewer Pipe 250 Ft. $7.85 0.% $1,962.50 $4.72 0.% $1,180.00 No Bid No Bid $5.88 0.% $1,470.00 $7.22 0.% $1,805.00 $5.79 0.% $1,447.50 No Bid $0.00

10 8" SDR 26 Sewer Pipe 250 Ft. $14.20 0.% $3,550.00 $8.57 0.% $2,142.50 No Bid No Bid $10.63 0.% $2,657.50 $13.05 0.% $3,262.50 $11.03 0.% $2,757.50 No Bid $0.00

11 3’ Fire Hydrant : Mueller 2 Ea. $2,664.45 0.% $5,328.90 $2,929.96 0.% $5,859.92 ####### 0.% $5,052.60 $2,657.87 0.% $5,315.74 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

12 3’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $2,664.45 0.% $5,328.90 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

13 3 ½’ Fire Hydrant : Mueller      2 Ea. $2,731.91 0.% $5,463.82 $3,000.04 0.% $6,000.08 ####### 0.% $5,173.46 $2,721.45 0.% $5,442.90 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

14 3 ½’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $2,731.91 0.% $5,463.82 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

15 4’ Fire Hydrant : Mueller 2 Ea. $2,794.91 0.% $5,589.82 $3,070.36 0.% $6,140.72 ####### 0.% $5,294.74 $2,785.25 0.% $5,570.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

16 4’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $2,794.91 0.% $5,589.82 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

17 4 ½’ Fire Hydrant : Mueller 2 Ea. $2,589.18 0.% $5,178.36 $3,140.36 0.% $6,280.72 ####### 0.% $5,415.44 $2,848.73 0.% $5,697.46 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

18 4 ½’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $2,589.18 0.% $5,178.36 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

19 5’ Fire Hydrant :Mueller 2 Ea. $2,924.09 0.% $5,848.18 $3,280.56 0.% $6,561.12 ####### 0.% $5,537.40 $2,912.37 0.% $5,824.74 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

20 5’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $2,924.09 0.% $5,848.18 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

21 5 ½’ Fire Hydrant : Mueller 2 Ea. $2,989.00 0.% $5,978.00 $3,280.56 0.% $6,561.12 ####### -1.% $5,712.56 $2,975.91 0.% $5,951.82 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

22 5 ½’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $2,989.00 0.% $5,978.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

23 6’ Fire Hydrant : Mueller 2 Ea. $3,053.91 0.% $6,107.82 $3,350.52 0.% $6,701.04 ####### 0.% $5,777.84 $3,039.38 0.% $6,078.76 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

24 6’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $3,053.91 0.% $6,107.82 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

25 7’ Fire Hydrant :Mueller 2 Ea. $3,183.73 0.% $6,367.46 $3,490.70 0.% $6,981.40 ####### 0.% $6,019.60 $3,166.55 0.% $6,333.10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
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26 7’ Fire Hydrant : Clow 2 Ea. $3,183.73 0.% $6,367.46 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

27 6” Mueller Hydrant Extension Kit 12 Ea. $373.44 0.% $4,481.28 $387.50 0.% $4,650.00 $387.50 0.% $4,650.00 $400.00 0.% $4,800.00 $423.31 0.% $5,079.72 $427.92 0.% $5,135.04 No Bid $0.00

28 12" Mueller Hydrant Extension Kit  10 Ea. $439.77 0.% $4,397.70 $448.95 0.% $4,489.50 $448.96 0.% $4,489.60 $463.44 0.% $4,634.40 $498.49 0.% $4,984.90 $503.92 0.% $5,039.20 No Bid $0.00

29 6” Clow Hydrant Extension Kit 7 Ea. $349.35 0.% $2,445.45 $442.97 0.% $3,100.79 No Bid No Bid $423.31 0.% $2,963.17 $423.31 0.% $2,963.17 $427.92 0.% $2,995.44 No Bid $0.00

30 12” Clow Hydrant Extension Kit 10 Ea. $411.40 0.% $4,114.00 $515.11 0.% $5,151.10 No Bid No Bid $498.49 0.% $4,984.90 $498.49 0.% $4,984.90 $503.92 0.% $5,039.20 No Bid $0.00

31 6” M&H Hydrant Extension Kit 5 Ea. $323.72 0.% $1,618.60 $391.80 0.% $1,959.00 No Bid No Bid $379.16 0.% $1,895.80 $379.16 0.% $1,895.80 $383.29 0.% $1,916.45 No Bid $0.00

32 12” M&H Hydrant Extension Kit 5 Ea. $369.07 0.% $1,845.35 $446.71 0.% $2,233.55 No Bid No Bid $432.30 0.% $2,161.50 $432.30 0.% $2,161.50 $437.00 0.% $2,185.00 No Bid $0.00

33
6” American- Darling Hydrant 

Extension Kit 5 Ea. $239.83 0.% $1,199.15 $316.66 0.% $1,583.30 No Bid No Bid $306.45 0.% $1,532.25 $306.45 0.% $1,532.25 $309.79 0.% $1,548.95 No Bid $0.00

34
12” American-Darling Hydrant 

Extension Kit 4 Ea. $278.84 0.% $1,115.36 $368.18 0.% $1,472.72 No Bid No Bid $356.30 0.% $1,425.20 $356.30 0.% $1,425.20 $360.18 0.% $1,440.72 No Bid $0.00

35 2" valve Box Riser 12 Ea. $32.17 0.% $386.04 $22.98 0.% $275.76 No Bid No Bid $21.53 0.% $258.36 $26.01 0.% $312.12 $28.45 0.% $341.40 No Bid $0.00

36 4" Valve Box Riser 10 Ea. $47.18 0.% $471.80 $36.56 0.% $365.60 No Bid No Bid $34.55 0.% $345.50 $35.64 0.% $356.40 $36.55 0.% $365.50 No Bid $0.00

37 6" Valve Box Riser 8 Ea. $64.34 0.% $514.72 $52.22 0.% $417.76 No Bid No Bid $49.35 0.% $394.80 $45.22 0.% $361.76 $52.22 0.% $417.76 No Bid $0.00

38 Clow Traffic Safety Flange Repair Kit 10 Ea. $181.33 0.% $1,813.30 $192.00 0.% $1,920.00 No Bid No Bid $185.81 0.% $1,858.10 $185.80 0.% $1,858.00 $187.83 0.% $1,878.30 No Bid $0.00

39
Mueller Traffic Safety Flange Repair 

Kit 10 Ea. $187.00 0.% $1,870.00 $192.00 0.% $1,920.00 $208.33 0.% $2,083.30 $215.05 0.% $2,150.50 $185.80 0.% $1,858.00 $187.83 0.% $1,878.30 No Bid $0.00

40 M&H Traffic Safety Flange Repair Kit 10 Ea. $131.00 0.% $1,310.00 $205.33 0.% $2,053.30 No Bid No Bid $198.71 0.% $1,987.10 $198.71 0.% $1,987.10 $200.87 0.% $2,008.70 No Bid $0.00

41
American-Darling Traffic Safety 

Repair Kit 10 Ea. $160.56 0.% $1,605.60 $170.00 0.% $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid $204.73 0.% $2,047.30 $164.52 0.% $1,645.20 $166.31 0.% $1,663.10 No Bid $0.00

42
2" Flush Hydrant (K77 Mainguard 

Post Hydrant) 4 Ea. $941.86 0.% $3,767.44 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $1,525.45 0.% $6,101.80 $1,576.30 0.% $6,305.20 $816.15 0.% $3,264.60 No Bid $0.00
Meter, Meter Boxes, Small Meter 

Box Lid (Lid Only)

43
  5/8"X3/4" polymer composite static 

meter with TRPL connector 6000 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $178.38 0.% $1,070,280.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $114.23 0.% $685,380.00

44
  5/8"X3/4" high copper alloy static 

meter with TRPL connector 6000 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

45
1" polymer composite static meter 

with TRPL connector 100 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $187.13 0.% $18,713.00

46
1" high copper alloy static meter 

with TRPL connector 100 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

47
1-1/2" X 13" Ultrasonic Meter 

w/Flange Ends with TRPL connector 5 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $721.35 0.% $3,606.75 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 ######## 0.% $7,646.10

48
2" X 17" Ultrasonic Meter w/Flange 

Ends with TRPL connector 8 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $914.85 0.% $7,318.80 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 ######## 0.% $13,015.68

49
3" X 17" Ultrasonic Meter w/Flange 

Ends with TRPL connector 5 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $1,418.85 0.% $7,094.25 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 ######## 0.% $11,352.60

50
2" Meter Flange Gasket & Bolt Pack 

(w/o brass flange) 50 Ea. $6.95 0.% $347.50 $6.00 0.% $300.00 No Bid No Bid $5.93 0.% $296.50 No Bid $0.00 $3.30 0.% $165.00 No Bid $0.00
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51 2" Brass Meter Flange 12 Ea. $46.26 0.% $555.12 $80.95 0.% $971.40 No Bid No Bid $48.33 0.% $579.96 $37.32 0.% $447.84 $41.62 0.% $499.44 No Bid $0.00

52
1-1/2" Meter Flange Gasket & Bolt 

Pack (w/o brass flange) 25 Ea. $2.84 0.% $71.00 $6.00 0.% $150.00 No Bid No Bid $5.77 0.% $144.25 No Bid $0.00 $3.50 0.% $87.50 No Bid $0.00

53 1-1/2" Brass Meter Flange 12 Ea. $35.96 0.% $431.52 $62.56 0.% $750.72 No Bid No Bid $41.92 0.% $503.04 $34.54 0.% $414.48 $34.98 0.% $419.76 No Bid $0.00

54 3/4" x 1/8" Meter Gaskets 1500 Ea. $.13 0.% $195.00 $.16 0.% $240.00 No Bid No Bid $.08 0.% $120.00 $.11 0.% $165.00 $.38 0.% $570.00 No Bid $0.00

55

      
DFW 1300-12-1T 63D plastic, 

rectangular, black box with black 500 Ea. $28.48 0.% $14,240.00 $21.96 0.% $10,980.00 No Bid No Bid $22.15 0.% $11,075.00 $21.96 0.% $10,980.00 $24.63 0.% $12,315.00 No Bid $0.00

56

     
1T 63D-Lid black plastic With 

resessed hole for AMI antenna. 100 Ea. $11.55 0.% $1,155.00 $8.35 0.% $835.00 No Bid No Bid $8.44 0.% $844.00 $10.00 0.% $1,000.00 $9.24 0.% $924.00 No Bid $0.00

57

      
DFW1730wbc -18-1KF 63D 

rectangular with black plastic lid 5 Ea. $372.05 0.% $1,860.25 $296.21 0.% $1,481.05 No Bid No Bid $267.60 0.% $1,338.00 $276.52 0.% $1,382.60 $294.00 0.% $1,470.00 No Bid $0.00

58

     
DFW1600.12.1T  63D rectangular 

with black plastic lid With resessed 5 Ea. $47.17 0.% $235.85 $37.98 0.% $189.90 No Bid No Bid $36.76 0.% $183.80 $37.98 0.% $189.90 $40.20 0.% $201.00 No Bid $0.00

59 ¾" x 12 Ford Meter Resetter 5 Ea. $145.90 0.% $729.50 No Bid $0.00 $113.71 0.% $568.55 $146.27 0.% $731.35 $116.10 0.% $580.50 $123.93 0.% $619.65 No Bid $0.00

60 ¾" x 9 Ford Meter Resetter 5 Ea. $140.95 0.% $704.75 No Bid $0.00 $109.86 0.% $549.30 $139.78 0.% $698.90 $112.17 0.% $560.85 $118.00 0.% $590.00 No Bid $0.00

61 ¾" x 7½ Ford Meter Resetter 9 Ea. $139.22 0.% $1,252.98 No Bid $0.00 $108.51 0.% $976.59 $130.26 0.% $1,172.34 $110.79 0.% $997.11 $116.94 0.% $1,052.46 No Bid $0.00

Brass Saddles & Fittings

62
6" x ¾” C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle 

with cc Thread 25 Ea. $67.15 0.% $1,678.75 $82.73 0.% $2,068.25 $55.57 0.% $1,389.25 $82.48 0.% $2,062.00 $56.73 0.% $1,418.25 $57.00 0.% $1,425.00 No Bid $0.00

63
6" x 1" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle 

with cc Thread 25 Ea. $67.15 0.% $1,678.75 $82.73 0.% $2,068.25 $55.58 0.% $1,389.50 $82.48 0.% $2,062.00 $56.73 0.% $1,418.25 $57.00 0.% $1,425.00 No Bid $0.00

64
8" x ¾” C-900Hinged Tapping Saddle 

with cc Thread 10 Ea. $93.99 0.% $939.90 $116.66 0.% $1,166.60 $77.77 0.% $777.70 $115.41 0.% $1,154.10 $79.41 0.% $794.10 $80.25 0.% $802.50 No Bid $0.00

65
8” x 1” C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle 

with cc Thread 10 Ea. $93.99 0.% $939.90 $116.66 0.% $1,166.60 $77.78 0.% $777.80 $115.41 0.% $1,154.10 $79.41 0.% $794.10 $80.25 0.% $802.50 No Bid $0.00

66
2" x 1" Tapping Saddle (2.90 o.d.) cc 

thread 2 Ea. $38.46 0.% $76.92 $36.00 0.% $72.00 $29.98 0.% $59.96 $35.61 0.% $71.22 $30.61 0.% $61.22 $25.50 0.% $51.00 No Bid $0.00

67
6" x 2" Tapping Saddle (6.63 o.d.) cc 

thread 2 Ea. $126.70 0.% $253.40 $157.33 0.% $314.66 $104.85 0.% $209.70 $153.98 0.% $307.96 $107.05 0.% $214.10 $108.50 0.% $217.00 No Bid $0.00

68 8" x 2" Tapping Saddle cc thread 2 Ea. $144.66 0.% $289.32 $162.16 0.% $324.32 $108.10 0.% $216.20 $160.41 0.% $320.82 $107.05 0.% $214.10 $111.60 0.% $223.20 No Bid $0.00

69

       
nut compression by Meter Nut 

w/Lock Wing 150 Ea. $64.87 0.% $9,730.50 $61.37 0.% $9,205.50 $48.22 0.% $7,233.00 $49.11 0.% $7,366.50 $48.11 0.% $7,216.50 $48.10 0.% $7,215.00 No Bid $0.00

70 ¾” x 5/8” x 2 ½” Meter Coupling 375 Ea. $15.10 0.% $5,662.50 $12.41 0.% $4,653.75 $10.33 0.% $3,873.75 $9.94 0.% $3,727.50 $10.55 0.% $3,956.25 $9.67 0.% $3,626.25 No Bid $0.00

71 ¾” x ¾” x 1” Tee (Q-nut compression) 50 Ea. $68.76 0.% $3,438.00 $61.14 0.% $3,057.00 $49.93 0.% $2,496.50 $48.94 0.% $2,447.00 $50.97 0.% $2,548.50 $52.65 0.% $2,632.50 No Bid $0.00

72
¾” Corp. stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc 

Thread Male 50 Ea. $70.68 0.% $3,534.00 $64.55 0.% $3,227.50 $51.33 0.% $2,566.50 $51.67 0.% $2,583.50 $52.41 0.% $2,620.50 $42.06 0.% $2,103.00 No Bid $0.00

73
1" Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc 

Thread Male 50 Ea. $92.94 0.% $4,647.00 $84.92 0.% $4,246.00 $67.48 0.% $3,374.00 $67.98 0.% $3,399.00 $68.91 0.% $3,445.50 $57.00 0.% $2,850.00 No Bid $0.00

74
2” Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc 

Thread Male 12 Ea. $344.49 0.% $4,133.88 $316.95 0.% $3,803.40 $250.15 0.% $3,001.80 $253.68 0.% $3,044.16 $255.42 0.% $3,065.04 $256.00 0.% $3,072.00 No Bid $0.00

75
2” Angle Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by 2” 

Meter Flange w/Lock Wing  12 Ea. $487.16 0.% $5,845.92 $417.88 0.% $5,014.56 $353.75 0.% $4,245.00 $334.47 0.% $4,013.64 $361.20 0.% $4,334.40 $357.00 0.% $4,284.00 No Bid $0.00
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76

      
Compression by 1” Meter Nut 

w/Lock Wing 7 Ea. $166.34 0.% $1,164.38 $157.21 0.% $1,100.47 $121.90 0.% $853.30 $124.49 0.% $871.43 $98.89 0.% $692.23 $110.00 0.% $770.00 No Bid $0.00

77
1 ½” Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by 

cc Thread Male 5 Ea. $208.28 0.% $1,041.40 $191.65 0.% $958.25 $151.25 0.% $756.25 $153.40 0.% $767.00 $154.43 0.% $772.15 $160.71 0.% $803.55 No Bid $0.00

78
1 ½” Angle Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by 

1 ½” Meter Flange w/Lock Wing  5 Ea. $383.77 0.% $1,918.85 $327.84 0.% $1,639.20 $278.68 0.% $1,393.40 $262.41 0.% $1,312.05 $255.42 0.% $1,277.10 $286.00 0.% $1,430.00 No Bid $0.00

79 ¾” Stainless Steel Inserts 375 Ea. $2.52 0.% $945.00 $1.89 0.% $708.75 $1.52 0.% $570.00 $2.07 0.% $776.25 $1.56 0.% $585.00 $1.47 0.% $551.25 No Bid $0.00

80 1” Stainless Steel Inserts 375 Ea. $2.67 0.% $1,001.25 $1.90 0.% $712.50 $1.60 0.% $600.00 $2.22 0.% $832.50 $1.65 0.% $618.75 $1.55 0.% $581.25 No Bid $0.00

81 2" x 2" Tees (MJ) 5 Ea. $115.24 0.% $576.20 $97.31 0.% $486.55 No Bid No Bid $291.38 0.% $1,456.90 $94.17 0.% $470.85 $96.55 0.% $482.75 No Bid $0.00

82
¾” 3 Part Union Q-nut Compression 

Ends 50 Ea. $64.54 0.% $3,227.00 $24.94 0.% $1,247.00 $19.37 0.% $968.50 $19.97 0.% $998.50 $19.77 0.% $988.50 $20.75 0.% $1,037.50 No Bid $0.00

83
1” 3 Part Union Q-nut Compression 

Ends 50 Ea. $69.07 0.% $3,453.50 $27.22 0.% $1,361.00 $22.15 0.% $1,107.50 $21.78 0.% $1,089.00 $22.62 0.% $1,131.00 $23.75 0.% $1,187.50 No Bid $0.00

84
¾” Ball Angle Stop Reduced Port 
Flare by Meter Nut w/Lock Wing 50 Ea. $63.68 0.% $3,184.00 $60.12 0.% $3,006.00 $47.35 0.% $2,367.50 $48.12 0.% $2,406.00 $47.22 0.% $2,361.00 $49.50 0.% $2,475.00 No Bid $0.00

85 ¾" 90 compression Q or G-nut ends 12 Ea. $34.47 0.% $413.64 No Bid $0.00 $25.03 0.% $300.36 $28.12 0.% $337.44 $25.55 0.% $306.60 $26.75 0.% $321.00 No Bid $0.00

86 1" 90 compression Q or G-nut ends 8 Ea. $44.27 0.% $354.16 No Bid $0.00 $32.14 0.% $257.12 $36.11 0.% $288.88 $32.82 0.% $262.56 $34.62 0.% $276.96 No Bid $0.00

87
2" 3-part union Q or G-nut 

compression ends 15 Ea. $375.84 0.% $5,637.60 No Bid $0.00 $100.07 0.% $1,501.05 $92.20 0.% $1,383.00 $102.18 0.% $1,532.70 $107.70 0.% $1,615.50 No Bid $0.00

88 2" PVC X CTS(pack Joint) 3-Part union 5 Ea. $554.86 0.% $2,774.30 No Bid $0.00 $119.05 0.% $595.25 $131.43 0.% $657.15 $154.35 0.% $771.75 $125.00 0.% $625.00 No Bid $0.00

89
1" straight stop Q or G-nut 

compression ends 75 Ea. $148.91 0.% $11,168.25 No Bid $0.00 $52.46 0.% $3,934.50 $120.87 0.% $9,065.25 $110.11 0.% $8,258.25 $94.50 0.% $7,087.50 No Bid $0.00

90
¾" straight stop Q or G-nut 

compression ends 75 Ea. $65.79 0.% $4,934.25 No Bid $0.00 $34.69 0.% $2,601.75 $49.01 0.% $3,675.75 $44.36 0.% $3,327.00 $47.25 0.% $3,543.75 No Bid $0.00
Clamps, Couplings, Tapping Sleeves, 

and Gate Valves

91 2” Hymax Repair Coupling 10 Ea. $172.55 0.% $1,725.50 $132.98 0.% $1,329.80 $151.45 0.% $1,514.50 $135.30 0.% $1,353.00 $127.33 0.% $1,273.30 $132.90 0.% $1,329.00 No Bid $0.00

92 3" Hymax Repair Coupling 12 Ea. $227.63 0.% $2,731.56 No Bid 0.% No Bid $199.79 0.% $2,397.48 $178.67 0.% $2,144.04 $167.98 0.% $2,015.76 $171.60 0.% $2,059.20 No Bid $0.00

93 4" Hymax Repair Coupling 6 Ea. $291.67 0.% $1,750.02 No Bid 0.% No Bid $256.00 0.% $1,536.00 $229.15 0.% $1,374.90 $210.80 0.% $1,264.80 $215.31 0.% $1,291.86 No Bid $0.00

94 6” Hymax Repair Coupling 25 Ea. $386.28 0.% $9,657.00 $290.68 0.% $7,267.00 $339.05 0.% $8,476.25 $302.13 0.% $7,553.25 $278.32 0.% $6,958.00 $281.22 0.% $7,030.50 No Bid $0.00

95 8” Hymax Repair Coupling 15 Ea. $436.13 0.% $6,541.95 $329.20 0.% $4,938.00 $382.80 0.% $5,742.00 $335.47 0.% $5,032.05 $315.19 0.% $4,727.85 $301.00 0.% $4,515.00 No Bid $0.00

96 10" Hymax Repair Coupling 5 Ea. $561.05 0.% $2,805.25 $418.54 0.% $2,092.70 $492.45 0.% $2,462.25 $431.09 0.% $2,155.45 $401.05 0.% $2,005.25 $406.00 0.% $2,030.00 No Bid $0.00

97 12" Hymax Repair Coupling 5 Ea. $662.22 0.% $3,311.10 $571.83 0.% $2,859.15 $581.25 0.% $2,906.25 $511.39 0.% $2,556.95 $490.05 0.% $2,450.25 $484.00 0.% $2,420.00 No Bid $0.00

98 6" Solid Sleeve  Repair Coupling 10 Ea. $147.51 0.% $1,475.10 $127.18 0.% $1,271.80 No Bid No Bid $93.79 0.% $937.90 $96.04 0.% $960.40 $103.00 0.% $1,030.00 No Bid $0.00

99 8" Solid Sleeve  Repair Coupling 10 Ea. $236.30 0.% $2,363.00 $203.62 0.% $2,036.20 No Bid No Bid $121.80 0.% $1,218.00 $124.73 0.% $1,247.30 $131.00 0.% $1,310.00 No Bid $0.00

100 10" Solid Sleeve  Repair Coupling 5 Ea. $282.84 0.% $1,414.20 $243.72 0.% $1,218.60 No Bid No Bid $218.63 0.% $1,093.15 $223.89 0.% $1,119.45 $181.00 0.% $905.00 No Bid $0.00
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101 12" Solid Sleeve  Repair Coupling 5 Ea. $380.94 0.% $1,904.70 $328.26 0.% $1,641.30 No Bid No Bid $245.43 0.% $1,227.15 $251.33 0.% $1,256.65 $213.00 0.% $1,065.00 No Bid $0.00

102
2”x 7.5” Full Circle Repair  Clamp 

(2.35 - 2.63 o. d.) 10 Ea. $61.59 0.% $615.90 $80.71 0.% $807.10 $74.89 0.% $748.90 $78.11 0.% $781.10 $47.80 0.% $478.00 $61.05 0.% $610.50 No Bid $0.00

103
2”x12.5” Full Circle Repair Clamp 

(2.35 - 2.63 o. d.) 10 Ea. $101.63 0.% $1,016.30 $131.80 0.% $1,318.00 $122.29 0.% $1,222.90 $127.55 0.% $1,275.50 $72.20 0.% $722.00 $101.70 0.% $1,017.00 No Bid $0.00

104
4" x 12.5" Full Circle Repair Clamp up 

to 5.57 od 10 Ea. $187.68 0.% $1,876.80 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $144.15 0.% $1,441.50 $150.32 0.% $1,503.20 $172.00 0.% $1,720.00 No Bid $0.00

105
6”x 7.5” Full Circle Repair Clamp 

(6.84 - 7.64 o. d.) 15 Ea. $140.40 0.% $2,106.00 $190.41 0.% $2,856.15 $176.67 0.% $2,650.05 $184.27 0.% $2,764.05 $114.40 0.% $1,716.00 $128.00 0.% $1,920.00 No Bid $0.00

106
6”x 12.5” Full Circle Repair Clamp 

(6.84 - 7.64 o.d.) 15 Ea. $206.70 0.% $3,100.50 $301.06 0.% $4,515.90 $279.34 0.% $4,190.10 $291.35 0.% $4,370.25 $162.11 0.% $2,431.65 $192.04 0.% $2,880.60 No Bid $0.00

107
8"x7.5" Full Circle Repair Clamp (8.99 

- 9.79 o.d.) 4 Ea. $158.42 0.% $633.68 $213.17 0.% $852.68 $197.79 0.% $791.16 $206.30 0.% $825.20 $120.00 0.% $480.00 $141.00 0.% $564.00 No Bid $0.00

108
10"x7.5"Full Circle Repair Clamp 

(11.60 - 12.40 o.d.) 3 Ea. $313.72 0.% $941.16 $400.34 0.% $1,201.02 No Bid No Bid $387.43 0.% $1,162.29 $137.90 0.% $413.70 $147.73 0.% $443.19 No Bid $0.00

109
12"x7.5" Full Circle Repair Clamp 

(14.00 - 14.40 o.d.) 2 Ea. $166.62 0.% $333.24 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $407.90 0.% $815.80 $124.18 0.% $248.36 $163.00 0.% $326.00 No Bid $0.00

110
12" x 15" Full Circle Repair Clamp 

12.75 - 13.55 OD 2 Ea. $498.32 0.% $996.64 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $390.02 0.% $780.04 No Bid $0.00

111
12" x 15" Full Circle Repair Clamp 

13.20 - 14.00 od 2 Ea. $498.32 0.% $996.64 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $390.02 0.% $780.04 No Bid $0.00

112
6”x 7.5”x ¾” Full Circle Tap(6.84 - 

7.64 o.d.) CC Thread 10 Ea. $181.48 0.% $1,814.80 $230.94 0.% $2,309.40 $214.28 0.% $2,142.80 $223.49 0.% $2,234.90 $89.64 0.% $896.40 $164.33 0.% $1,643.30 No Bid $0.00

113
6" x 7.5" x 1" Full Circle Tap 6.84 - 

7.64 od, CC thread 10 Ea. $181.48 0.% $1,814.80 $230.94 0.% $2,309.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $89.64 0.% $896.40 $164.33 0.% $1,643.30 No Bid $0.00

114
6”x 12.5”x ¾”Full Circle Tap(6.84 - 

7.64 o.d.) CC thread 10 Ea. $247.78 0.% $2,477.80 $341.62 0.% $3,416.20 $316.97 0.% $3,169.70 $330.60 0.% $3,306.00 $152.47 0.% $1,524.70 $229.25 0.% $2,292.50 No Bid $0.00

115 2" MJ 90° Ductile Iron 10 Ea. $95.39 0.% $953.90 $80.55 0.% $805.50 No Bid No Bid $76.13 0.% $761.30 $77.96 0.% $779.60 $77.00 0.% $770.00 No Bid $0.00

116 2" MJ Kit W/Gland 15 Ea. $47.29 0.% $709.35 $16.11 0.% $241.65 No Bid No Bid $22.53 0.% $337.95 No Bid $0.00 $24.15 0.% $362.25 No Bid $0.00

117 6” MJ/MJ  Gate Valve 7 Ea. $832.31 0.% $5,826.17 $873.71 0.% $6,115.97 $785.11 0.% $5,495.77 $802.83 0.% $5,619.81 $744.09 0.% $5,208.63 $835.00 0.% $5,845.00 No Bid $0.00

118 6” MJ/FLG Gate Valve 5 Ea. $832.31 0.% $4,161.55 $873.71 0.% $4,368.55 $785.12 0.% $3,925.60 $802.83 0.% $4,014.15 $752.39 0.% $3,761.95 $835.00 0.% $4,175.00 No Bid $0.00

119 8" MJ/MJ Gate Valve 2 Ea. $1,325.60 0.% $2,651.20 $1,362.55 0.% $2,725.10 ####### 0.% $2,500.86 $1,278.65 0.% $2,557.30 $1,198.09 0.% $2,396.18 $1,314.32 0.% $2,628.64 No Bid $0.00

120 8" MJ/FLG Gate Valve 2 Ea. $1,300.61 0.% $2,601.22 $1,336.89 0.% $2,673.78 ####### 0.% $2,453.72 $1,254.54 0.% $2,509.08 $1,175.32 0.% $2,350.64 $1,314.32 0.% $2,628.64 No Bid $0.00

121 6" MJ Kit W/Gland 12 Ea. $69.77 0.% $837.24 $27.06 0.% $324.72 No Bid No Bid $36.04 0.% $432.48 $64.52 0.% $774.24 $41.82 0.% $501.84 No Bid $0.00

122 2" MJ Kit Less Gland 12 Ea. $28.24 0.% $338.88 $16.11 0.% $193.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $15.60 0.% $187.20 $16.98 0.% $203.76 No Bid $0.00

123 6" MJ Kit Less Gland 12 Ea. $32.05 0.% $384.60 $27.06 0.% $324.72 No Bid No Bid $22.70 0.% $272.40 $26.20 0.% $314.40 $27.06 0.% $324.72 No Bid $0.00

124 8" MJ Kit Less Gland 12 Ea. $36.63 0.% $439.56 $30.93 0.% $371.16 No Bid No Bid $24.22 0.% $290.64 $29.94 0.% $359.28 $30.75 0.% $369.00 No Bid $0.00

125 10" MJ Kit Less Gland 5 Ea. $48.08 0.% $240.40 $40.60 0.% $203.00 No Bid No Bid $30.70 0.% $153.50 $39.30 0.% $196.50 $42.00 0.% $210.00 No Bid $0.00

126 12" MJ Kit Less Gland 5 Ea. $49.61 0.% $248.05 $41.88 0.% $209.40 No Bid No Bid $32.44 0.% $162.20 $40.54 0.% $202.70 $43.55 0.% $217.75 No Bid $0.00
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127 12" MJ/MJ Gate Valve 2 Ea. $2,615.34 0.% $5,230.68 $2,688.25 0.% $5,376.50 ####### 0.% $4,934.08 $2,522.70 0.% $5,045.40 $2,363.96 0.% $4,727.92 $2,648.83 0.% $5,297.66 No Bid $0.00

128 8" MJ Kit W/Gland 12 Ea. $93.95 0.% $1,127.40 $46.40 0.% $556.80 No Bid No Bid $39.83 0.% $477.96 $86.88 0.% $1,042.56 $46.25 0.% $555.00 No Bid $0.00

129 10" MJ Kit W/Gland 5 Ea. $163.72 0.% $818.60 $66.37 0.% $331.85 No Bid No Bid $51.20 0.% $256.00 $158.71 0.% $793.55 $67.15 0.% $335.75 No Bid $0.00

130 12" MJ Kit  W/Gland 5 Ea. $171.63 0.% $858.15 $68.31 0.% $341.55 No Bid No Bid $55.74 0.% $278.70 $158.71 0.% $793.55 $69.10 0.% $345.50 No Bid $0.00

131 6" Anchor Coupling (DI) 3 Ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $224.72 0.% $674.16 No Bid $0.00 $237.80 0.% $713.40 No Bid $0.00

132 6"x13" Hydrant Coupling 3 Ea. $264.22 0.% $792.66 $237.80 0.% $713.40 No Bid No Bid $224.72 0.% $674.16 $230.12 0.% $690.36 $237.80 0.% $713.40 No Bid $0.00

133 Valve Box W/Lid  10"(box) 7¾"(lid) 10 Ea. $43.97 0.% $439.70 $52.00 0.% $520.00 No Bid No Bid $54.06 0.% $540.60 $67.87 0.% $678.70 $68.00 0.% $680.00 No Bid $0.00

134 Valve Box Lid only (7¾") 8 Ea. $17.16 0.% $137.28 $13.00 0.% $104.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $14.02 0.% $112.16 $18.62 0.% $148.96 No Bid $0.00

135 4" Clay to PVC Non Shear Coupling 10 Ea. $43.33 0.% $433.30 $6.20 0.% $62.00 No Bid No Bid $32.98 0.% $329.80 $27.61 0.% $276.10 $49.83 0.% $498.30 No Bid $0.00

136 6" Clay to PVC Non Shear Coupling 10 Ea. $73.49 0.% $734.90 $13.25 0.% $132.50 No Bid No Bid $56.17 0.% $561.70 $46.84 0.% $468.40 $83.51 0.% $835.10 No Bid $0.00

137 8" Clay to PVC Non Shear Coupling 10 Ea. $83.59 0.% $835.90 $21.96 0.% $219.60 No Bid No Bid $64.98 0.% $649.80 $53.28 0.% $532.80 $94.98 0.% $949.80 No Bid $0.00

138
6" Anchor 90 MJ swivel x swivel 

(Tyler Union) 5 Ea. $308.62 0.% $1,543.10 $277.75 0.% $1,388.75 No Bid No Bid $262.48 0.% $1,312.40 $268.79 0.% $1,343.95 $277.75 0.% $1,388.75 No Bid $0.00

139 6" MJ cross Ductile Iron 3 Ea. $338.69 0.% $1,016.07 $304.82 0.% $914.46 No Bid No Bid $288.05 0.% $864.15 $294.98 0.% $884.94 $308.25 0.% $924.75 No Bid $0.00

140 6" MJ 90 ductile PIron 5 Ea. $162.54 0.% $812.70 $146.28 0.% $731.40 No Bid No Bid $138.24 0.% $691.20 $141.57 0.% $707.85 $147.93 0.% $739.65 No Bid $0.00

Total  $345,694.90  $245,936.01      $165,978.49      $1,345,048.21      $201,855.08      $259,412.63      $736,107.38 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT TO BE 

AWARDED TO EACH LOWEST 
BIDDER

verfied 
dollars 
TS/DL  $   77,497.21 

verfied 
dollars 
TS/DL  $     5,728.52 

verfied 
dollars 
TS/DL  $      91,113.19 

verfied 
dollars 
TS/DL  $   70,807.02 

verfied 
dollars 
TS/DL  $   41,330.93 

verfied 
dollars 
TS/DL  $704,093.00 

OVERALL BID AMOUNT TO BE 
AWARDED  $990,569.87 

Disqualified incomplete 
submission

EVALUATION COMMENTS:
Item #11 was pulled over in the report as $292.96 

instead of the bid amount of $2929.96. Item #31 was 
pulled as $391.00 instead of bid amount of $391.80.  
Item #59 was the same bid as another bidder. After 

discussion with the warehouse manager it was 
deemed to go with the other bidder due to issues with 
customer service and billing problems.  Item #81 was 

pulled as $91.31 and bid amount is $97.31

Bidder is looking to cancel items 
17, 18 and 52 since they 

submitted incorrect bid amounts 
for those items. 

item #52 is being awarded to this 
vendor as next lowest bidder.

Item #17 is being awarded to this 
vendor as next lowest bidder
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