Price Comparison Current Advance Auto Sun Coast
DESCRIPTIO PROD OR EQUIVA 0 ATED BID PR BID PR BID PR
QuUA PR PR
1 Engine Oil 15W-40 Bulk: Shell Rotella T5 Synthetic Blend 15W-40 2000 Gals. PerGal: | $ 9.99 $ 19,980.00 | fPerGal: | $ - S - per Gal: | $ 17.00 $ 34,000.00
eels or exceeds the requirements of: i
Cummins CES 20086, Ford WSS-M2C171-F1 NOQ BID
2 Engine Oil 5W-30 Bulk: Pennzoil Platinum Full Synthetic 5W-30 600 Gals. PerGal..|$ 8.18 S 4,908.00 [ |Per Gal.:| § - S Per Gal.:| § 74.84 $ 14,904.00
eels or exceeds the requirements of: ;
dexos 1 Gen2, NO BID
3 ine Oil 5W-20 Bulk : Motorcraft Synthetic Blend 5W-20 85 Gals. PerGal: | $  7.50 s 637.50 § |PerGal: | - S Per Gal: | § 2647 S 2,249.95
[Weets of exceeds the requirements of: Ford Wa5-
M2C960-A1, API SN Plus 6 Gal. Box NO BID
a4 |Engine Oil OW-20 Bulk : Motorcraft Full Synthetic OW-20 60 Gals. PerGal: | $ 13.33 $ 799.80 | |PerGal: [ $ 20.70 $  1,242.00 | fPerGal: | $ 30.88 5 1,852.80
meets or exceeds the requirements of: Ford WSS-
M2C947-B1, APISN 6 Gal. Box
5 |Engine Qil 15W-40 ; Motorcraft Super Duty Formula 15W-40 180 Qts. PerQt: | S 4.47 5 804.60 f fPerQt: |5 4.59 s 826.20 } |Ferat: | S 7.54 5 1,357.20
Meets or exceeds the requirements of: Ford WSS-
M2C171-F1 12 gts/case
6 Engine Qil 0W-40: Pennzoil Ultra Platinum Synthetic 0W-40 120 Qts. PerQt: | S 6.39 $ 766.80 ffPerat: | S  5.97 S 71640 P Perat: | S $
|Meets or exceeds the requirements of: Chrysler MS;
12633, APISN 12 gts/case NO BID
7 Transmission Fluid: Motocraft Mercon V Full Synthetic ATF 60 Qts. PerQt: | S 4.58 S 274.80 f fPerQt: | S 855 5 513.00 | fPerQt: | 5 717 $ 430.20
Manufacturer Part # XT-5-5QMC 12 gts/case
8 Transmission Fluid: Motocraft Mercon LV Full Synthetic ATF 150 Qts. PerQt: |$ 6.27 S 940.50 | {PerQt: | $ 7.35 $  1,102.50 f fPerat: | 5 717 $  1,075.50
Manufacturer Part # XT-10-QLVC 12 gts/case
9 Transmission Fluid: AC Delco Dexron VI Full Synthetic ATF 240 Qts. PerQt: |$ 6.23 S 1,495.20 fPerQt: | S 8.08 $  1,939.20 f{Perat: | S 01 5 192240
Manufacturer Part # 10-9243 12 gts/case
10 Transmission Fluid: Chevron Delo Syn ATF 668. 150 Gals. PerGal: [ § 43.99 % 6,598.50 f{PerGal: | $ - S PerGal: | $ 42.55 5 6,382.50
1ﬂe€'E or exceeds the requirements of: Allison TES-
668 1 Gal. Jugs NO BID
11 Hydraulic Oil Bulk: Shell Tellus $2 MX 32 Hydraulic Fluid - AW32
Group Il 2200 Gals. PerGal: [§ 732 [$ 16,104.00 ffPerGal: [ - NO BID PerGal: | § 1675 $ 36,850.00
12 Hydraulic Qil Bulk: Shell Tellus S2 MX 68 Hydraulic Fluid - AW68
Group i! 300 Gals. PerGal: | ¢ 986 |$ 295800 [fPerGal:|s . NO BID PerGal: | §  14.24 $  4,272.00
_joroup
13 |Grease Bulk: Chevron Delo Grease EP 13) 16 Gal
NLG! Grade 2 Kegs - 120
Ibs. each Perlb: |S 148 S 532.80 f{Perlb: |[S 3.10 5 1,116.00 f {Perlb: | S 4.45 5 1,602.00
14  |Grease Tube: Chevron Delo Grease EP Per Per Per
NLGI Grade 2 14 oz tube 1402 1402 140z
200 Tubes Tube: S 262 5 524.00 | {Tube: $ 551 $  1,102.00 | {Tube: 5 472 S 5944.00
15 Grease Tube: ATCO Impact Extra Heavy Duty Non Melt Grease Per Per Per B
NLGI Grade 2.5 140z tubes Manufacturer Product 1oz 1402 140z
(Code: 4179-C50 500 Tubes Tuba: S 829 S 4,145.00 § i Tube: S 624 $ 3,120.00 | JTube: NO BID
16 i Exh: Fluid Bulk: [|Diese! Exhaust Fluid - ISO 22241 Compliant/APi
Certified 8800 Gals. PerGal: | § 144 | | $ 12,672.00 jifPerGal: |5 . NO BID PerGal: | § 3.13 $ 27,544.00
17 Diesel Exhaust Fluid: Diesel Exhaust Fluid - 1SO 22241 Compliant/API 500 Gals.
Certified (2.5 Gal. Jug
Each) PerGal: |$ 264 $  1,320.00 f{PerGal: f$ S5.52 $  2,760.00 | JPerGal: | § 530 S 2,650.00
Petroleum Lowest Petroleum Lowest Bid
Bid Total: $7,020.60 Total: $103,030.55
Petroleum Total $61,469.50] Combined Total of Lowest Petroleum Bids: $110,051.15
DEF Total $13,992.008 DEF Lowest Bid Total: $30,194.00
Combined Total $75,461.50 Combined Total of Petroleum & DEF Lowest Bids: $140,245.15

Petroleum Bids Higher Than Current By:
DEF Bids Higher Than Cuirrent By:

Combined Total Higher Than Current By:

79.00%

116.00%

86.00%




