

1-FIRE HYDRANTS & TUBING

Description	Qty	U.O.M	VENDOR ACT PIPE & SUPPLY		VENDOR AQUA METRIC		VENDOR FERGUSON		VENDOR JOHNSON LAB & SUPPLY		
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
1. ¾" Endopure Poly Tubing/300' Rolls	10,200	Ft.	.24	2,448 ⁰⁰	No Bid		.21	2,142 ⁰⁰	No Bid		
2. 1" Endopure Poly Tubing/300' Rolls	30,000	Ft.	.41	12,300 ⁰⁰	No Bid		.34	10,200 ⁰⁰			
3. 3' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea	1,420	7,100 ⁰⁰	No Bid		1,554 ³⁰	7,771 ⁵⁰			
4. 3 ½' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea	1,447 ⁵⁰	7,237 ⁵⁰	No Bid		1,592 ⁴⁰	7,962 ⁰⁰			
5. 4' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea	1,475 ⁰⁰	7,375 ⁰⁰	No Bid		1,630 ⁰²	8,150 ¹⁰			
6. 4 ½' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea	1,507 ⁵⁰	7,537 ⁵⁰	No Bid		1,668 ¹⁵	8,340 ⁷⁵			
7. 5' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea	1,540	7,700 ⁰⁰	No Bid		1,705 ⁷⁴	8,528 ⁷⁰			
8. 5 ½' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea	1,560 ⁰⁰	7,800 ⁰⁰	No Bid		1,743 ⁸⁵	8,719 ²⁵			
9. 6' Fire Hydrant	2	Ea	1,590 ⁰⁰	3,180 ⁰⁰	No Bid		1,781 ⁴⁵	3,562 ⁹⁰			
10. 7' Fire Hydrant	2	Ea	1,650 ⁰⁰	3,300 ⁰⁰	No Bid		1,857 ¹⁵	3,714 ³⁰		No Bid	

2-METERS & METER BOXES

Description	Qty		VENDOR ACT PIPE & SUPPLY		VENDOR AQUA METRIC		VENDOR FERGUSON		VENDOR JOHNSON LAB & SUPPLY	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1. 5/8 x 3/4" positive displacement residential meters (threaded)	2500		N/A		39.23 ^{12"}	98,075 ^{12"} 150,025	44.25	110,625 ⁰⁰		No Bid
2. 1" positive displacement meters (threaded)	100		N/A		84.13 150.74	8,413 15,074	152 ⁰⁰	15,200 ⁰⁰		
3. 1 1/2" Compound meters with flange ends	25		N/A		874 ⁰⁴	17,430 ⁸⁰	391 ¹¹	9,777 ⁷⁵		
4. 2" Compound meters with flange ends	25		N/A		1,008 ⁵¹	20,190 ²⁰	575 ¹²	14,378 ⁰⁰		
5. Small Plastic Water Meter Box D1300 STD plastic, rectangular, black box with black plastic lid and plastic reader 12" x 17" x 12" or 12" H x 12 5/16" W x 17 9/16" L	2000		15.45	30,900 ⁰⁰		No Bid	15.65	31,300 ⁰⁰		No Bid

3-BRASS SADDLES AND FITTINGS

Description	Qty	U.O.M	VENDOR ACT PIPE & SUPPLY		VENDOR AQUA METRIC		VENDOR FERGUSON		VENDOR JOHNSON LAB & SUPPLY	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1. 6" x 3/4" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	300	Ea	36.05	10,815 ⁰⁰		No Bid	36.90	11,070 ⁰⁰	38.50	11,550
2. 6" x 1" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	1500	Ea	36.05	54,075			36.95	55,425 ⁰⁰	38 ⁵⁰	57,750

3. 8" x 3/4" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	200	Ea	50.56	10,112 ⁰⁰	No Bid	51 ⁶⁵	10,330 ⁰⁰	53 ⁸⁹	10,778
4. 8" x 1" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	500	Ea	50.56	25,280 ⁰⁰		51.70	25,350 ⁰⁰	53 ²⁹	26,945
5. 3/4" Ball Angle Stop Reduced Port Q-nut compression by Meter Nut w/Lock Wing	2000	Ea	31.75	63,500 ⁰⁰		32 ³⁵	64,700	34 ¹⁰	68,200
6. 3/4" x 5/8" x 2 1/2" Meter Coupling	2500	Ea	6.99	17,475 ⁰⁰		7 ¹⁰	17,750	7 ⁴⁸	18,700
7. 3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Tee (Q-nut compression)	1000	Ea	33.90	33,900 ⁰⁰		34 ²⁵	34,250 ⁰⁰	36 ¹⁴	36,140
8. 3/4" Corp. stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	500	Ea	34 ⁸⁴	17,420 ⁰⁰		35 ⁰⁰	17,600 ⁰⁰	25 ¹¹	12,555
9. 1" Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	1500	Ea	45 ³⁶	68,790		46 ³⁵	69,525 ⁰⁰	37 ⁹⁷	56,955
10. 2" Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	75	Ea	169 ⁵⁰	12,712 ⁰⁰		173 ⁵⁰	13,012 ⁵⁰	181 ⁰⁵	13,573 ⁷⁵
11. 2" Angle Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by 2" Meter Flange w/Lock Wing	75	Ea	139 ⁵⁰	10,462 ⁰⁰		245 ³⁵	18,401 ²⁵	256 ⁰³	19,200 ²⁵
12. 1" Angle Stop Ball Valve Q-nut Compression by 1" Meter Nut w/Lock Wing	50	Ea	82 ⁰⁵	4,102 ⁰⁰		83 ⁸⁰	4,190 ⁰⁰	87 ⁴²	4,391 ⁰⁰ 4,371
13. 1 1/2" Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	25	Ea	102 ⁷⁷	2,569 ²⁵		104 ⁹⁰	2,622 ⁵⁰	109 ⁴⁷	2,736 ⁷⁵
14. 1 1/2" Angle Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by 1 1/2" Meter Flange w/Lock Wing	25	Ea	189 ²¹	4,730 ²⁵		193 ³⁰	4,832 ⁵⁰	201 ⁷⁰	5,042 ⁵⁰
15. 3/4" Stainless Steel Inserts	3,000	Ea	1.12	3,360 ⁰⁰		1.17	3,510	1 ¹⁸	3,540
16. 1" Stainless Steel Inserts	5,000	Ea	1.17	5,850 ⁰⁰		1.25	6,250 ⁰⁰	1 ²⁶	6,300
17. 3/4" 3 Part Union Q-nut Compression Ends	200	Ea	14.04	2,808 ⁰⁰		14 ³⁵	2,870 ⁰⁰	14 ⁹⁸	2,996 ⁰⁰
18. 1" 3 Part Union Q-nut Compression Ends	150	Ea	16.05	2,407 ⁵⁰	No Bid	16 ⁴⁰	2,460 ⁰⁰	17 ¹²	2,568
19. 3/4" Ball Angle Stop Reduced Port Flare by Meter Nut w/Lock Wing	250	Ea	31 ³⁹	7,847 ⁵⁰		32 ¹⁰	8,025	33 ⁴⁷	8,367 ⁵⁰

1-FIRE HYDRANTS & TUBIING

			<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>	
			ZENNER USA							
<u>Description</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>U.O.M</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>
1. ¾" Endopure Poly Tubing/300' Rolls	10,200	Ft.	No Bid							
2. 1" Endopure Poly Tubing/300' Rolls	30,000	Ft.								
3. 3' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea								
4. 3 ½' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea								
5. 4' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea								
6. 4 ½' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea								
7. 5' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea								
8. 5 ½' Fire Hydrant	5	Ea								
9. 6' Fire Hydrant	2	Ea								
10. 7' Fire Hydrant	2	Ea	No Bid							

2-METERS & METER BOXES

			<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>	
			ZENNER USA							
<u>Description</u>	<u>Qty</u>		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>
1. 5/8 x 3/4" positive displacement residential meters (threaded)	2500		33 ⁸⁰	84,500						
2. 1" positive displacement meters (threaded)	100		80 ¹³	8,013 ⁰⁰						
3. 1 1/2" Compound meters with flange ends	25		223 ²⁴	5,581 ⁰⁰						
4. 2" Compound meters with flange ends	25		1,395 ²¹	34,880 ²⁵						
5. Small Plastic Water Meter Box D1300 STD plastic, rectangular, black box with black plastic lid and plastic reader 12" x 17" x 12" or 12" H x 12 5/16" W x 17 9/16" L	2000		No Bid							

3-BRASS SADDLES AND FITTINGS

				<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>		<u>VENDOR</u>	
				ZENNER USA							
<u>Description</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>U.O.M</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Extended Price</u>	
1. 6" x 3/4" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	300	Ea	No Bid								
2. 6" x 1" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	1500	Ea	No Bid								
3. 8" x 3/4" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	200	Ea	No Bid								

4. 8" x 1" C-900 Hinged Tapping Saddle with cc Thread	500	Ea	<i>No Bid</i>								
5. 3/4" Ball Angle Stop Reduced Port Q-nut compression by Meter Nut w/Lock Wing	2000	Ea									
6. 3/4" x 5/8" x 2 1/2" Meter Coupling	2500	Ea									
7. 3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Tee (Q-nut compression)	1000	Ea									
8. 3/4" Corp. stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	500	Ea									
9. 1" Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	1500	Ea									
10. 2" Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	75	Ea									
11. 2" Angle Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by 2" Meter Flange w/Lock Wing	75	Ea									
12. 1" Angle Stop Ball Valve Q-nut Compression by 1" Meter Nut w/Lock Wing	50	Ea									
13. 1 1/2" Corp. Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by cc Thread Male	25	Ea									
14. 1 1/2" Angle Stop (ball valve) Q-nut by 1 1/2" Meter Flange w/Lock Wing	25	Ea									
15. 3/4" Stainless Steel Inserts	3,000	Ea									
16. 1" Stainless Steel Inserts	5,000	Ea									
17. 3/4" 3 Part Union Q-nut Compression Ends	200	Ea									
18. 1" 3 Part Union Q-nut Compression Ends	150	Ea									
19. 3/4" Ball Angle Stop Reduced Port Flare by Meter Nut w/Lock Wing	250	Ea		<i>No Bid</i>							