1 Concrete, 3,000 PSI 35000 | Per Cubic Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 225.00 0% ,000.00 No Bid No Bid 170.00 0% 950,000.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Concrete, 3,000 PS! plus 2% calcium 500 Per Cubic Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 240.00 0% | $120,000.00 No Bid No Bid 190.00 0% $95,000.00 No Bid No Bid
3 Concrete, 4,000 PSI 325 Per Cubic Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 255.00 0% $82,875.00 No Bid No Bid 190.00 0.% $61,750.00 No Bid No Bid
4 Concrete, 4,000 PS! plus 2% calcium 325 Per Cubic Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 275.00 0% $89,375.00 No Bid No Bid 210.00 0% $68,250.00 No Bid No Bid
5 8 Sac Grout 250 Per Cubic Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 205.00 0% 51,250.00 o Bid No Bid 230.00 0.% $57,500.00 No Bid No Bid
6 3/8" F FOB Plant 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 0% $14,250.00 145.00 0% 145,000.00 14.50 0% 14,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 3/8" F FOB Destination 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.52 0% $22,520.00 160.00 0% 160,000.00 22.50 0% 22,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1/2" D FOB Plant 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 145.00 0% 145,000.00 18.00 0% 18,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 1/2" D FOB Destination 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 155.00 0% 155,000.00 24.50 0% 24,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 1"D FOB Plant 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.26 0% $12,260.00 155.00 0% 155,000.00 18.00 0% 18,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1" D FOB Destination 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 520.52 0% $20,520.00 65.00 0% 165,000.00 24.50 0% 24,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 White 30000 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.80 0% $24,000.00 No Bid No Bid 4.50 0% 135,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 — Yellow 15000 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid .80 0.% $12,000.00 No Bid No Bid 4.50 0% $67,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 T Black 8000 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 575 0% $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid 4.50 0% $36,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 Crack seal Material — Polyflex Il 100000 Per Pound No Bid No Bid 570 0% $70,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.50 0% | $150,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 Type D Asphalt FOB Plant 25000 Per Ton $79.00 0% | $1,875,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00 0% | $4,125,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.00 0% | $2,350,000.00
17 Type C Asphalt FOB Plant 1500 Per Ton $79.00 0% | $118,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00 0% 247,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $92.00 0% | $138,000.00
18 Cold Mix Asphalt FOB Plant 2500 Per Ton $92.00 0% | 5230,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00 0.% 412,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.00 0% | $262,500.00
19 Cold Mix Asphalt FOB Destination 2500 Per Ton $104.00 0% | $260,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 175.00 0% 437,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Quality Sandy Loam (Topsoil) FOB Plant 4000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 0% 340,000.00 $20.00 0% $80,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 Quality Sandy Loam (Topsoil) FOB Destination 10000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 0% 850,000.00 $20.00 0% | $200,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Base Material FOB Plant 9800 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.27 0% $81,046.00 $66.00 0% 646,800.00 9.00 0% $88,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 Base Material FOB Destination 13000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.53 0% | $214,890.00 60.00 0% 780,000.00 15.50 0% | $201,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Rip Rap Rock 18-24” FOB Plant 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.78 0% 30,780.00 175.00 0% 175,000.00 30.00 0% 30,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 Rip Rap Rock 18-24" FOB Destination 1500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.18 0% 63,270.00 185.00 0% 277,500.00 36.50 0% 54,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 Rip Rap Rock 12-18” FOB Plant 1000 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.78 0% 30,780.00 140.00 0% 140,000.00 30.00 0% 30,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 Rip Rap Rock 12-18” FOB Destination 1500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.18 0% 63,270.00 150.00 0% 225,000.00 36.50 0% 54,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 Rip Rap Rock 8-12" medium FOB Plant 500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 140.00 0% $70,000.00 30.00 0% 15,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 Rip Rap Rock 8-12" medium FOB Destination 500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00 0% $75,000.00 36.50 0% 18,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 Rip Rap Rock 3-5” FOB Plant 1500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.11 0% $19,665.00 $95.00 0% | $142,500.00 14.50 0% 21,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 Rip Rap Rock 3-5" FOB Destination 5500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.37 0% | $128,535.00 $105.00 0% | $577.500.00 21.00 0% [ $115500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EP) Glass Traffic Beads Type Il FOB Plant 2500 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.80 0% $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid 3.80 0% $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 Glass Traffic Beads Type II FOB Destination 2500 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $.83 0.% $2,075.00 No Bid No Bid 3.95 0% $9,875.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Glass Traffic Beads Type Il FOB Plant 24000 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.10 0% 5$26,400.00 No Bid No Bid 3.80 0% $91,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 Glass Traffic Beads Type IIl FOB Destination 24000 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.10 0.% $26,400.00 No Bid No Bid 3.75 0% 90,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 Crusher Fines FOB Plant 2500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.60 0% $9,000.00 $70.50 0% 176,250.00 $6.50 0% 16,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 Crusher Fines FOB Destination 2500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 59.60 0% $24,000.00 $70.50 0% 176,250.00 $13.00 0% 32,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 M-Sand Sand) FOB Plant 2500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.60 0% $24,000.00 $70.50 0% 176,250.00 $10.00 0% 25,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
39 M-sand Sand) FOB Destination 2500 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.30 0% $45,750.00 568.90 0.% 172,250.00 $16.50 0% 41,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
40 Traffic Paint Latex Quick Dry YELLOW 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
a1 Traffic Paint Latex Quick Dry FIRELANE RED 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Traffic Paint Latex Quick Dry BLACK 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 Traffic Paint Latex Quick Dry WHITE 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
a4 ‘Traffic Paint Latex Quick Dry HANDICAP BLUE 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 Traffic Paint Water Based YELLOW 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Traffic Paint Water based FIRELANE RED 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
a7 Traffic Paint Water Based BLACK 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 Traffic Paint Water Based WHITE 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 Traffic Paint Water Based HANDICAP BLUE 2000 Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

COMMENTS

Review vendor altematives page 26-27,
39, opening fee $5k after hours page 49.

Minimum 4 ton delivery, less than 4 COK
require pickup, material and beads 1 ton
increments, see page additional info
attachment and bid form in packet.

After consideration, this vendor was not
selected due to past contract

performance.

Vendor is the next responsible bidder,
selected as alternate, if Asphalt, Inc. dba
Lone Stare is not available.




